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Q uestion O riginalresponse(F0190091] Points raised by enquirer at Formal Review FindingspresentedtoR eview Group O utcom eofForm alR eview
(F0191198)

[1.] Please
provide
information on
the discharge
of salmon
farming well
boats since 1
January 2018.

[2] Please
include details,
maps, photos,
grid references,
licences and
any other
information
relating to
where, when,
what and how
salmon
farming well
boats
discharge their
effluents.

[3.] For
example, there
is apparently a
marked/
designated
area off Oban
where
discharges
take place.
Please provide
information
relating to any
designated
places around
Scotland where
salmon
farming well
boats are
permitted to
discharge
effluents.

[4.] Please
provide

Q uestions[1]– [5]

W econfirm thatS EP A does
notholdtherequested
inform ationin1-5above.T his
inform ationistherefore
exceptedunderR egulation
10(4)(a)oftheEIR s.T hetext
ofw hichisreproducedbelow ;
(4)A S cottishpublicauthority
m ay refusetom ake
environm entalinform ation
availabletotheextentthat;-
(a)itdoesnotholdthat
inform ationw henan
applicant'srequestis
received.
T heexceptioninregulation
10(4)(a)issubjecttothe
publicinteresttestin
regulation10(1)(b)oftheEIR s.
AsS EP A doesnotholdthe
inform ationinquestionthere
isnoconceivablepublic
interestinrequiringthatthe
inform ationbem ade
available.

U ndertheterm sofR egulation
9 oftheEIR s,S EP A hasaduty
toprovideadviceand
assistance,w eadvisethatw ell
boatsarelicencedby M arine
S cotland.Inaccordancew ith
R egulation14(1)(b)ofthe
EIR s,w eadviseyou tocontact
M arineS cotlanddirectly for
thisinform ation.T hecontact
detailsare;
M arineS cotlandM ailpoint11
1B S outhVictoriaQ uay,
Edinburgh,EH6 6Q Q
m arinescotland@ gov.scot
https://w w w .gov.scot/about/
contact-inform ation/how -to-
request-inform ation/

Please consider this a formal request for a review of F:0191091.

Could you please double-check your response which seems
clearly inadequate and incomplete?

[Questions 1-5]

Scottish Salmon Watch has huge difficulty in believing that SEPA
does not have information in relation to points 1-5.

For example, in the Scotland's Aquaculture database which
Scottish Salmon Watch understands that SEPA has responsibility
for it states that "NB This dataset does not include treatments
carried out on wellboats. The full annual SPRI data returns
inclusive of wellboat information can be found here":
http://aquaculture.scotland.gov.uk/data/fish_farms_monthly_
biomass_and_treatment_reports.aspx

Sadly, SPRI data for 2018 is still not available (which is shocking
in itself):
https://www.sepa.org.uk/environment/environmental-
data/spri/

However, SEPA has surely inputted and accessed well boat data
for 2017 (and perhaps for some or all of 2018) from Marine
Scotland or other parties since 1 January 2018.

More specifically, there would surely be correspondence with
Marine Scotland, the Scottish Government and other parties in
relation to well boat data as presented via Scotland's
Aquaculture and/or the SPRI.

Hence, please double-check your records and response to
Scottish Salmon Watch's FOI dated 23 October 2019 which, inter
alia, asked for:

Please provide information in relation to what quantities of
effluent are discharged - including any data on discharges of
toxic chemicals, diseased waters and other materials.

Please include any correspondence, emails, Cabinet Briefings,
data, sampling results, testing and other information relating to
salmon farming well boat discharges since 1 January 2018.

[Question 6]

Finally, in relation to SEPA's refusal to provide information on
Benchmark's CleanTreat which SEPA admits to possessing "a

1.S copeofForm alR eview

T heenquirercontactedS EP A on11 N ovem ber2019 seekingaForm alR eview of
S EP A’sfailuretoreleaseinform ationheldby S EP A inaresponsetotherequest
forinform ationoriginally receivedon23 O ctober2019.

T heissuesconsideredinthisForm alR eview areoutlinedinthetablebelow :

Q uestion IssuesconsideredintheForm al
R eview

Response to Questions 1 -
5

 W hetherregulation10(4)(a)ofthe
EIR sisapplicabletothew ithheld
inform ation.

 T hereafterconsiderreleasibility of
w ithheldinform ation.

Response to Question 6  W hetherregulation10(5)(f)ofthe
EIR sisapplicabletothew ithheld
inform ation.

 T hereafterconsiderreleasibility of
w ithheldinform ation.

2. Handlingoftheoriginalrequest

T heForm alR eview O fficerreportedthattheoriginalrequestcontainedsix
questions.

Q uestions[1]-[5]relatedtoinform ationrelatingtow ellboatdischarges.
Q uestion[6]soughtinform ationontheCleantreattreatm entsystem .

T heresponsew assenttotheenquireron11 N ovem ber2019.

3.Findings

Issue Findings

1. Whether regulation
10(4)(a) of the EIRs is
applicable to the withheld
information – Questions
[1] – [5].

 T hescopeofregulation10(4)(a)
oftheEIR sw asconsideredin
relationtothew ithheld
inform ation.

Questions [1], [4] and [5]

 T heForm alR eview O fficer
reportedthatfeedbackw as
soughtfrom colleaguesregarding
dataonw ellboatdischarges
subm ittedforS P R I.

 Itw asconfirm edthatS EP A does
holddataonw ellboatdischarges
for2018subm ittedby M arine
S cotlandforinclusioninS P R I.

T heGroupnotedthepoints
raisedby theenquirerinhis
requestforaForm alR eview .

T heGroupthenconsideredthe
findingsoftheForm alR eview .
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Q uestion O riginalresponse(F0190091] Points raised by enquirer at Formal Review FindingspresentedtoR eview Group O utcom eofForm alR eview
(F0191198)

information in
relation to
what
quantities of
effluent are
discharged -
including any
data on
discharges of
toxic
chemicals,
diseased
waters and
other
materials.

[5.] Please
include any
correspondenc
e, emails,
Cabinet
Briefings, data,
sampling
results, testing
and other
information
relating to
salmon
farming well
boat
discharges
since 1 January
2018
.
[6] Please
include any
information
relating to
CleanTreat and
the treatment
of well boats
discharges
including
details of any
meetings and
correspondenc
e with
Benchmark
and other

[6.]
S EP A holdsasm allam ountof
correspondence.T his
inform ationisexceptedunder
R egulation10(5)(f)oftheEIR s.
T hetextofw hichis
reproducedbelow ;
(5)A S cottishpublicauthority
m ay refusearequesttom ake
environm entalinform ation
availableto
theextentthatitsdisclosure
w ould,orw ouldlikely to
prejudicesubstantially-

small amount of correspondence", Scottish Salmon Watch asks
SEPA to reconsider your refusal.

SEPA admits to meeting Benchmark at least five times in 2018
and 2019:

Please redact the names of the individuals by all means but
refusing to disclose any information on those meetings flies in
the face of Freedom of Information. SEPA is a publicly funded
agency and surely it must be held publicly accountable. Please
therefore provide the information requested.

 Itw asconfirm edthatw henthe
2018 dataw asreceivedfrom
M arineS cotlandthe
azam ethiphosanddeltam ethrin
figuresw ereextracted,m atched
totheS P R IID andCAR licence
andthencollatedinthe
spreadsheetM CFF-
W ellboatT reatm ents-2018,w hich
w assenttotheS P R Iteam .

 T heM arineS cotlanddata
includesdetailsofdischarges
relatingtospecifiedM arine
S cotlandlicences.

 T hedatacollatedby S EP A for
inclusioninS P R Iincludes
consolidateddataondischarges
inrelationtospecifiedCAR
licences.

 R ecom m endationthatthe
exceptionundertheterm sof
R egulation10(4)(a)shouldnot
beupheldinrelationto
Q uestions[1],[4] and[5},as
S EP A holdsinform ation.

 Three items are released with this
response.

Questions [2] and [3]

 T heForm alR eview O fficer
soughtfeedbackonw hether
S EP A holdsdetailedinform ation
onthelocationofperm itted
w ellboatdischarges.

 Itw asconfirm edthatS EP A does
notholdtherequested
inform ation.

 T heForm alR eview O fficernoted
thatM arineS cotlandpublishes
detailsoflicenceapplicationsand
grantedlicencesontheirw ebsite
athttp://m arine.gov.scot/m slot-
all-application-and-project-
docum entation. L icencescanbe
locatedby sitenam eorlicence
num ber.

 Itw asnotedthattheS P R Idata
returnscontainsitenam esand
licencenum bersw hichcouldbe

T heGroupagreedw iththe
recom m endationthatexception
undertheterm sofR egulation
10(4)(a)shouldnotbeupheldin
relationtoQ uestions[1],[4]
and[5},asS EP A holds
inform ation.
T heGroupnotedthatthree
item sarereleasedw iththis
response.

T heGroupagreedw iththe
rrecom m endationthatthe
exceptionundertheterm sof
R egulation10(4)(a)shouldbe
upheldinrelationtoQ uestions
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Q uestion O riginalresponse(F0190091] Points raised by enquirer at Formal Review FindingspresentedtoR eview Group O utcom eofForm alR eview
(F0191198)

companies. Pl
ease include
information
relating to
"high level
talks to
facilitate trials
of the
[CleanTreat]
system in
Scotland".

(f)theinterestsoftheperson
w hoprovidedtheinform ation
w herethatperson-
(i)w asnotunder,andcould
nothavebeenputunder,any
legalobligationtosupply the
inform ation;
(ii)didnotsupply itin
circum stancessuchthatit
could,apartfrom these
R egulations,bem ade
available;and
(iii)hasnotconsentedtoits
disclosure
T hereleaseoftheinform ation
inquestionw ouldbelikely to
prejudicesubstantially the
thirdparty.T heP ublicInterest
T estw ascarriedoutin
relationtotheinform ationto
bew ithheldunderR egulation
10(5)(f)oftheEIR s.Inthis
case,w erecognisethat
R egulation10(2)(b)requires
S EP A toapply apresum ption
favourofdisclosure.T he
publicinterestinfavourof
disclosureisoutw eighedby
thatinfavourofw ithholding.
R equestsforsuchinform ation
areconsideredby S EP A ona
caseby casebasis.Inthis
case,itw asdeterm inedthat
thepublicinterestw ouldnot
beservedby thereleaseof
theinform ationatthistim e.

W econfirm thatS EP A has
attendedm eetingsw ith
Benchm arkon9 O ctober
2018,11 April2019,30 M ay
2019,20 S eptem ber2019 and
30 S eptem ber2019

usedasthebasisofasearchof
theM arineS cotlandlicence
w ebsite.

 R ecom m endationthatthe
exceptionundertheterm sof
R egulation10(4)(a)shouldbe
upheldinrelationtoQ uestions
[2] and[3},asS EP A doesnot
holdtherequestedinform ation.

See further detail below.

2. Consideration of the
applicability of the
exception under the terms
of regulation 10(5)(f) to
the withheld information –
Question [6].

 T heForm alR eview O fficer
reportedthatthecontentofthe
collatedinform ationhadbeen
review ed. Itw asnotedthatthe
inform ationincluded
correspondencereceivedby
S EP A,sentby S EP A andinternal
correspondence.

 R ecom m endationthatthe
exceptionundertheterm sof
R egulation10(5)(f)shouldnotbe
upheldinrelationtoQ uestion
[6].

3. Consideration of the
applicability of the
exception under the terms
of regulation 10(5)(e) to
the withheld information

 T heForm alR eview O fficer
reportedthat57 item shadbeen
collatedinrelationtoQ uestion
[6].

 Feedbackw assoughtfrom
colleaguesastothenatureofthe
collatedinform ation.

 Feedbackw assoughtand
receivedfrom relevantthird
partiesandconsideredduringthe
Form alR eview .

 R ecom m endationthatthe
exceptionatregulation10(5)(e)
oftheEIR sshouldbeappliedto
thecollatedinform ationheldby
S EP A andthattheinform ation
w ouldcontinuetobew ithheld.

 See further detail below.

Information withheld and not released with this response

W ehaveidentifiedinform ationanddocum entsthatcannotbereleasedinto
thepublicdom ainatthistim e. T hetablebelow outlinesthetypesof
inform ationandtheexceptionthatisbeingapplied. Furtherinform ationonthe

[2] and[3},asS EP A doesnot
holdtherequestedinform ation.

T heGroupagreedw iththe
recom m endationthatexception
undertheterm sofR egulation
10(5(f)shouldnotbeupheldin
relationtoQ uestion[6].

T heGroupagreedw iththe
recom m endationthatthe
exceptionatregulation10(5)(e)
oftheEIR sshouldbeappliedto
thecollatedinform ationheldby
S EP A inrelationtoQ uestion[6]
andthattheinform ationw ould
continuetobew ithheld.
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Q uestion O riginalresponse(F0190091] Points raised by enquirer at Formal Review FindingspresentedtoR eview Group O utcom eofForm alR eview
(F0191198)

reasonsforw ithholdingtheinform ationisprovidedbelow ,w ithdetailsofeach
exception.

T ypeofinform ation N um berof
docum ents

O utcom e

A.Inform ationrelating
tow ellboatdischarges
-Q uestions[2]and[3].

N /A Inform ationnotheld
W ithheld under
regulation10(4)(a)of
theEIR s

B.Inform ationrelating
toCleantreat–
Q uestion[6].

57 W ithheldinfullunder
regulation10(5)(e)of
theEIR s

A pplicationofexceptionsundertheterm softheEIR s

A. - Application of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information not held – Questions [2] and
[3].

T hisdisclosure ofthe inform ation isexcepted underR egulation 10(4)(a)ofthe
EIR s.T hetextofw hichisreproducedbelow ;

(4) A Scottish public authority may refuse to make environmental
information available to the extent that;-

(a) it does not hold that information when an applicant's request is
received.

T heForm alR eview O fficeroutlinedthescopeofexceptionatR egulation10(4)(a)
oftheEnvironm entalInform ation(S cotland)R egulations2004.

T hedetailedbriefingpreparedby theO fficeoftheS cottishInform ation
Com m issionerw asalsoconsulted-http://itspublicknow ledge.info/L aw /FO IS A-
EIR sGuidance/EIR sexceptionbriefings/R egulation10(4)(a)Inform ationnotheld.as
px.

T he exception in regulation 10(4)(a) issubject to the public interest test in
regulation10(1)(b)oftheEIR s.AsS EP A doesnotholdtheinform ationinquestion
thereisnoconceivablepublicinterestinrequiringthattheinform ationbem ade
available.

R ecom m endationthattheexceptionundertheterm sofR egulation10(4)(a)of
the EIR sshould be applied to theinform ation requested in Q uestions[2] and
[3].

B.-Commercial interests – Regulation 10(5)(e) of the EIRs – Question 6

R egulation10(5)(e)statesthataS cottishpublicauthority m ay refusetom ake
environm entalinform ationavailabletotheextentthatitsdisclosurew ould,or
w ouldbelikely to,prejudicesubstantially theconfidentiality ofcom m ercialor
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Q uestion O riginalresponse(F0190091] Points raised by enquirer at Formal Review FindingspresentedtoR eview Group O utcom eofForm alR eview
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industrialinform ationw heresuchconfidentiality isprovidedforby law to
protectalegitim ateeconom icinterest.

T heForm alR eview O fficeroutlinedthescopeofexceptionatR egulation10(5)
(e)oftheEnvironm entalInform ation(S cotland)R egulations2004.

T herelevantsectionofthebriefingpreparedby theO fficeoftheS cottish
Inform ationCom m issionerw asalsoconsulted-
http://itspublicknow ledge.info/L aw /EIR s/EIR sExceptions.aspx

T heForm alR eview O fficerreportedonthetestssetdow nby theS cottish
Inform ationCom m issionerontheapplicationofR egulation10(5)(e)ofthe
EIR s. Itw asconfirm edthatdetailsofthespecifiedtreatm entw erenotpublicly
availableandthatthey w erecom m ercialinnature.

Feedbackhadbeensoughtfrom thethirdparty w hoconfirm edthatdisclosure
ofinform ationw ouldcausesubstantialprejudicetotheircom m ercialinterests.

Inthespecificcircum stancesofthisrequest,S EP A considersthatthereleaseof
thecorrespondenceanddocum entationw ouldcauseasubstantialprejudiceto
thecom m ercialundertakingandeconom icinterest. S EP A thereforecontends
thatthepublicinterestinthereleaseoftheinform ationisoutw eighedby the
publicinterestinm aintainingtheexceptionundertheterm sofR egulation
10(5)(e)oftheEIR s

R ecom m endation that inform ation relating to the requested inform ation
should continue to be w ithheld,at thistim e,underthe term sofR egulation
10(5)(e)ofthe Environm entalInform ation (S cotland)R egulations2004,after
theapplicationoftheP ublicInterestT est,asnotedabove.


